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The data you generate and 
manipulate on a daily basis is 
your business lifeblood. Not 
only is it critical to your opera-
tion but its security and reli-
ability can be one of your 
greatest, unspoken concerns.   
 

What would you do in the 
event of a catastrophe in your 
business? What if there was a 
fire, flood, storm, locusts, 
lightning strike or electrical 
failure in your area that de-
stroyed your workstations, 
your file server or your data 
backups? Do you have a con-
tingency plan? How much 
time could you afford to be 
“down?” 
 

HWeb SafetyNet from The 
Hudson Group is your simple 
and cost-effective solution for 
managing such an event, 
should it ever occur. It can 
rescue you from disaster.  
 

HWeb SafetyNet will backup 
your critical Hudson files auto-
matically, on a daily basis 
(overnight) to secure off-site 
mirrored remote locations.  
 

Registering for the HWeb 
SafetyNet  will supplement 
your existing backup program. 
(You do have one, right?)  
Now you will have a redun-
dant  off-site system in addi-
tion to relying upon your staff  
to complete a backup onto 
CD-ROM, DVD-ROM, DAT or 
other media.  

 

Hudson staff will monitor 
that all backups are com-
pleted on schedule and oc-
curred without incident.   
 

In the event of catastrophe, 
you will have the ability, using  
any computer, Terminal Ser-

vices and an Internet Connec-
tion... to connect to the 
backup server and operate on 
a virtual platform until you are 
able to rebuild or restructure 
your office network. 
 

This 
means that 
there would 
be virtually 
no interrup-
tion in your 
normal 
business 
workflow, in 
the event of an emergency. 
You will be able to do remote 
order entry and dispatching, 
including the remote printing 
of manifests  and other opera-
tional information. 
 

Once your replacement 
equipment is in place and 
connected to the internet, 

Hudson Technical Support 
staff will be able to remotely 
configure and restore your 
office network in about 30 
minutes!   
 

Sounds Good ~ How much 
does it cost?  
<20 Vehicles ~ $50/month 
<35 Vehicles ~ $75/month 
35+ Vehicles ~ $125/month 
Additional charges may apply 
in the event you wish to 
backup other non-Hudson 
files.  
 

So for <$2-$4 per day, you 
will gain the peace of mind 
knowing that in the event of  
emergency or disaster, you 
will not miss a client or forget 
a reservation and can quickly 
restore your office network. 
 

Where will you be and what 
will you be doing when your 

server fails? What 
happens when a 
fire, flood, or storm 
hits your facility? 
What happens 
when a disgruntled 
employee vandal-
izes your system? 
….With HWeb 
SafetyNet,  you 

have your solution, and peace 
of mind! 
 

For more information,  or to 
enroll today, call us at 
617.499.1959 and press 3 
for our Sales Department, or 
send an e-mail to: 
Sales@HudsonLtd.com. 

WE ’RE BACKING YOU  UP ! 

“HWeb Safety 
Net... can Res-
cue you from 

disaster.” 

I N S I D E  T H I S  I S S U E :  

HWeb SafetyNet 1 

28 State Street 
Suite 1100 
Boston, Massachusetts 02109 
T: 617.499.1959 
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